

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

150 South Fifth Street, Suite 700
Minneapolis, MN 55402

(612) 337-9300

41-1225694

November 26, 2022

Statement No. 171183

Item 4Civ.
BCWMC 12-15-22

Bassett Creek Water Management Commission

Laura Jester

Bassett Creek Watershed
16145 Hillcrest Lane
Eden Prairie, MN 55346

Through October 31, 2022

BA295-00001	General	1,763.80
BA295-00056	Main Stem Lagoon Dredging Project	183.60

Total Current Billing: 1,947.40

I declare, under penalty of law, that this account, claim or demand is just and correct and that no part of it has been paid.

DocuSigned by:

Dave Anderson

2677F7DA9EC14AF...

Signature of Claimant

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

150 South Fifth Street, Suite 700
 Minneapolis, MN 55402

Bassett Creek Water
 Laura Jester

October 31, 2022

BA295-00001 General

Through October 31, 2022

For All Legal Services As Follows:

			Hours	Amount
10/3/2022	DTA	Review emails from C LaBounty regarding Four Seasons Mall site and other docs related to same; emails regarding matter with L Jester, K Chandler, Plymouth staff	0.30	61.20
10/5/2022	DTA	Review docs and past commission minutes regarding Four Seasons project; conference call with K Chandler, L Jester, C LaBounty regarding matter	0.60	122.40
10/10/2022	DTA	Additional work on Four Seasons CIP agreement with Plymouth; review recent docs provided by C LaBounty; emails and call with C LaBounty; calls with K Chandler and L Jester regarding same and need for broader discussion/meeting; emails and phone call with K Chandler, P Brockamp regarding data practices questions regarding bids	1.30	265.20
10/11/2022	DTA	Emails from K Chandler regarding Four Seasons discussion; Preparation for and participate in Teams call with K Chandler, L Jester, and C LaBounty regarding Four Seasons project, agreement language, issues related to same; additional follow-up emails regarding same	0.80	163.20
10/12/2022	DTA	Additional work on agreement for Four Seasons CIP project with Plymouth; calls with K Chandler and J Herbert regarding same; review and revise latest agreement form; emails regarding same	0.80	163.20
10/17/2022	DTA	Phone call with L Jester regarding meeting location and potential notifications related to moving this week's meeting	0.10	20.40
10/18/2022	DTA	Review channel maintenance agreement with Plymouth; emails with L Jester regarding same	0.50	102.00
10/19/2022	DTA	Review meeting packet ahead of tomorrow's monthly meeting	0.40	81.60
10/20/2022	DTA	Travel to Golden Valley City Hall to attend monthly meeting	3.20	652.80
10/27/2022	DTA	Review paddling map and language contained on website regarding same; emails with L Jester regarding same	0.40	81.60

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

150 South Fifth Street, Suite 700
Minneapolis, MN 55402

Bassett Creek Water
Laura Jester

October 31, 2022

10/28/2022	DTA	Call with L Jester regarding paddling map	0.20	40.80
------------	-----	---	------	-------

Total Services: \$ 1,754.40

For All Disbursements As Follows:

10/20/2022		David Anderson - Mileage		9.40
------------	--	--------------------------	--	------

Total Disbursements: \$ 9.40

Total Services and Disbursements: \$ 1,763.80

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

150 South Fifth Street, Suite 700
Minneapolis, MN 55402

Bassett Creek Water
Laura Jester

October 31, 2022

BA295-00056 Main Stem Lagoon Dredging Project

Through October 31, 2022

For All Legal Services As Follows:

			Hours	Amount
10/5/2022	DTA	Emails regarding matter with L Jester and K Chandler; conference call with L Jester and K Chandler	0.20	40.80
10/12/2022	DTA	Prepare resolution accepting bids for project; additional emails with P Brockamp, L Jester, K Chandler related to data practices issues and commissioner access to bid tabs; review P Brockamp's memo	0.60	122.40
10/20/2022	DTA	Discuss signatures on agreement with K Chandler	0.10	20.40
Total Services:			\$	183.60
Total Services and Disbursements:			\$	183.60