

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

150 South Fifth Street, Suite 700
Minneapolis, MN 55402

(612) 337-9300
41-1225694

November 17, 2023
Statement No. 178029

Bassett Creek Water Management Commission

Laura Jester

Bassett Creek Watershed
16145 Hillcrest Lane
Eden Prairie, MN 55346

Through October 31, 2023

BA295-00001	General	1,256.98
BA295-00056	Main Stem Lagoon Dredging Project	1,053.50

Total Current Billing: 2,310.48

I declare, under penalty of law, that this account, claim or demand is just and correct and that no part of it has been paid.

DocuSigned by:

David Anderson

Signature of Claimant

Page: 1

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered150 South Fifth Street, Suite 700
Minneapolis, MN 55402Bassett Creek Water
Laura Jester

October 31, 2023

BA295-00001 General

Through October 31, 2023

For All Legal Services As Follows:

			Hours	Amount
10/11/2023	DTA	Call with L Jester related to Bryn Mawr project and potential amendment	0.20	43.00
10/16/2023	DTA	Prepare amendment to Bryn Mawr cooperative agreement; email to L Jester with comments; review meeting packet	1.10	236.50
10/18/2023	DTA	Emails and discussion related to county works group; review statutory provisions and prepare response to emails related to same	0.30	64.50
10/19/2023	DTA	Travel to GV city hall and attend monthly meeting; additional emails and discussion before meeting related to agenda item related to county action group	3.80	817.00
10/20/2023	DTA	Call with L Jester related to JPA and questions related to commission authority under JPA, updated JPA, other items	0.40	86.00
Total Services:			\$	1,247.00

For All Disbursements As Follows:

10/18/2023	David Anderson; Mileage expense	9.98
Total Disbursements:		\$ 9.98

Total Services and Disbursements: \$ 1,256.98

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

150 South Fifth Street, Suite 700
 Minneapolis, MN 55402

Bassett Creek Water
 Laura Jester

October 31, 2023

BA295-00056 Main Stem Lagoon Dredging Project

Through October 31, 2023

For All Legal Services As Follows:

			Hours	Amount
10/2/2023	MEW	Draft settlement agreement with Fitzgerald	1.40	301.00
10/4/2023	DTA	Review draft settlement agreement; call with M Weinberg related to same	0.40	86.00
10/4/2023	MEW	Confer with D. Anderson regarding settlement agreement; revisions to agreement; email client regarding same	0.60	129.00
10/5/2023	MEW	Revise and transmit draft settlement agreement to counsel for Fitzgerald	0.60	129.00
10/10/2023	MEW	Follow up emails and phone call regarding status of settlement agreement	0.40	86.00
10/11/2023	DTA	Emails related to status of settlement agreement	0.10	21.50
10/13/2023	DTA	Call and emails with M Weinberg related to signed agreement	0.10	21.50
10/18/2023	DTA	Emails related to settlement agreement with M Welch, M Weinberg	0.40	86.00
10/18/2023	MEW	Communications with D. Anderson regarding client question on settlement agreement	0.30	64.50
10/20/2023	DTA	Call with L Jester and emails related to surety request for status update, next steps related to agreement	0.30	64.50
10/20/2023	MEW	Emails with client and Fitzgerald's counsel regarding final, fully executed settlement agreement	0.30	64.50
Total Services:			\$	1,053.50
Total Services and Disbursements:			\$	1,053.50